
HEALTH SUPPLIES 2023/2024 

Health Supplies discount for the 2023/2024 School Year 

William V. MacGill & Co 
1000 Lombard Rd 

Lombard, Il   60148 
www.macgill.com 

800-323-2841

You may take 7% off SUPPLY items from their 
2023 CATALOG. 

Shipping of $12.95 will be added to orders under $65.00 

Exclusions from this discount 
• Furniture & Equipment
• See attached for more exclusions

Select equipment receives a 5% discount.  Email Tiffany Turner at 
tturner@bville.org if you need a price. 

THIS PRICING ENDS JUNE 30, 2024

http://www.macgill.com/
mailto:tturner@bville.org


WILLIAM V. MACGILL AND CO.  2023 EXCLUSIONS
The following items are excluded from percentage-off discounts.

Item # Description Price

1483 Dial Soap $24.99

4738 Tooth Necklaces $15.95

7189 Cavicide Gallon $35.95

7199 Citrus II Gallon $36.50

9862 Understanding Asthma Chart $24.93

12007 Prevent the Flu Poster $16.95

12443 MyPlate Kids Poster $16.95

12449 Handy Portions Poster $16.95

12451 Hand Washing Poster $13.99

12452 Wash Hands/Brush Teeth Poster Set $16.95

12460 Don't Tease, Boss, or Bully Poster $9.50

12461 If Someone Bullies You Poster $9.50

12462 You Can Help Stop Bullying Poster $9.50

12473 Bully Free Zone Poster $9.50

13046 Sugar Shockers Poster $16.95

13047 LIVE 54321 + 8 Poster $16.95

13052 Energy Balance Snack Poster $16.95

13053 What is a Bully Poster? $13.95

13054 Social Bullying Poster $13.95

13056 Physical Bullying Poster $13.95

13057 Emotional Bullying Poster $13.95

13058 Stop It Poster $13.95

13235 Cyber Bullying Poster $16.95

13236 Bully Free Poster Set $12.99

14029 Nutrition Poster $16.95

14034 Deadly Allergen Poster $14.95

14085 Partners in Care Services $42.00

14086 Partners in Care Services $84.00

14209 Partners in Care Services $366.00

14210 Partners in Care Services $716.00

14421 Partners in Care Services $324.00

14422 Partners in Care Services $636.00

15245 School Nurse Poster Set $19.00

15400 N95 Face Masks *call for price 

16254 Braun ThermoScan Pro 6000 Thermometer w/Sm Cradle $249.00

16255 Braun ThermoScan Pro 6000 Thermometer w/Lg Cradle $259.00

16289 Suicide Prevention Poster $13.95

17025 Purell Disinfectant Gallon $27.49

18012 Cocaine Poster $23.95

18014 Heroin Poster $23.95

18015 Steroids Poster $23.95

18016 Ecstacy Poster $23.95

18094 Vaping Poster $14.95

18190 Partners in Care Services $412.00

18191 Partners in Care Services $1,112.00

19065 Ziploc Flexible Totes, Jumbo $10.49

19133 Active Shooter Poster, 12" x 18" $13.90

19171 Flu Symptoms and Signs Poster $14.75

19172 When Sick Kids Should Stay Home $14.75

19173 Concussions in Highschool Sports $14.75

19174 CPR, Child, First Aid Poster $14.75

19175 Choking First Aid Poster $14.75

Items may be added without notice to the "No Bid" list; items noted with (NB) on your invoice indicate "No Bid." Pricing is subject to change. 
William V. MacGill and Co., 1000 N. Lombard Rd., Lombard, IL 60148  (800) 323-2841   macgill@macgill.com 



WILLIAM V. MACGILL AND CO.  2023 EXCLUSIONS
The following items are excluded from percentage-off discounts.

19176 Infant, Child, CPR, Choking, Poisoning & Burns Poster $14.75

20161 Stay Home Sick Poster $14.99

20162 Wash Hands Poster $14.99

20163 Dental Emergencies Poster $14.75

20164 Drink Water Poster $16.95

20169 Vaping Poster $23.95

20170 Vaping Poster $14.95

20171 Vaping Poster $14.95

20172 Vaping Poster $14.95

20173 Vaping Poster $14.95

20174 Vaping Poster $14.95

20175 Vaping Poster $14.95

20391 Wash Hands Poster $14.99

20430 Clorox Wipes $41.69

20431 Clorox Wipes $38.49

20490 Luna TrueClot Hemorrhage Kit $699.00

22016 Visual DX: Dermatology $140.00

22144 Sugar Shockers Poster, Spanish $16.95

22145 Sugar Shockers Foods Poster $16.95

22971 Smoking Poster $23.95

22972 Marijuana Poster $23.95

22973 Inhalants Poster $23.95

22975 Alcohol Poster $23.95

22986 Facts About Alcohol Poster $19.75

22987 Facts About Smoking Poster $19.75

25001 Welch Allyn SureTemp Plus 690 $297.00

25002 Welch Allyn SureTemp Plus 690 $310.00

28808 Be Active Poster $16.95

28809 Examine the Facts Nutrition Labels Poster $16.95

32269 Rolling Carrying Case for Optec $390.00

32501 Adult Choking Chart $18.95

32502 Adult CPR Chart $18.95

32503 Child CPR Chart $18.95

32504 Infant CPR Chart $18.95

32509 The Skeletal System Chart $10.95

32510 The Muscular System Chart $10.95

32511 The Digestive System Chart $10.95

32512 The Circulatory System Chart $10.95

32513 Child Choking Chart $18.95

34900 Remote Display Scale $229.00

36660 Saniwash Hand Soap Gallon $49.99

36678 Portion Distortion Poster $16.95

36691 Think Your Drink Poster $11.95

36692 Fast Food Poster $16.95

42301 Wash Your Hands Poster $15.99

42303 Wash Your Hands Poster $15.99

42304 Cover Your Cough & Sneeze Poster $15.99

42305 What's On Your Hands Poster $15.99

42306 If You Are Sick, Don't Go Poster $15.99

68973 Clorox Healthcare Hospital Cleaner Refill $33.95

71341 Envirocide Gallon $42.99

75120 Lice B Gone Gallon $71.50

75171 Clorox $59.50

Items may be added without notice to the "No Bid" list; items noted with (NB) on your invoice indicate "No Bid." Pricing is subject to change. 
William V. MacGill and Co., 1000 N. Lombard Rd., Lombard, IL 60148  (800) 323-2841   macgill@macgill.com 



WILLIAM V. MACGILL AND CO.  2023 EXCLUSIONS
The following items are excluded from percentage-off discounts.

75172 Clorox $48.99

75176 Wash Hands Poster $5.00

75179 Wash Hands Poster $5.00

75180 Wash Hands Poster $8.95

75181 Wash Hands Poster $8.95

75316 BMI Chart Poster $16.95

79100 Justin Recovery Couch with Steel Legs $689.00

79101 Justin Recovery Couch with Wooden Legs $699.00

79200 Lindsay Recovery Couch with Steel Legs $599.00

79201 Lindsay Recovery Couch with Wooden Legs $609.00

79211 Lindsay Preschool Recovery Couch with Steel Legs $499.00

79212 Lindsay Preschool Recovery Couch with Wooden Legs $509.00

79300 Bradley Recovery Couch with Steel Legs $549.00

79301 Bradley Recovery Couch with Wooden Legs $559.00

79325 Economy Recovery Couch with Steel Legs $499.00

79326 Economy Recovery Couch with Wooden Legs $509.00

89430 Skeletal System Chart $21.50

89460 Muscular System Chart $21.50

97650 STI Chart $24.93

97700 Methamphetamine Poster $23.95

97703 Drinking and Driving Poster $19.75

98640 Understanding Allergies Chart $24.93

98650 Dangers of Smoking Chart $24.93

98750 Understanding Common Cold Chart $24.93

98920 Middle Ear Conditions $24.93

215608 Purell 1000 ml Refill $15.99

217608 Purell with Aloe 1000 ml Refill $21.09

n/a Barjan Cubicle Curtains - custom item; pricing varies -

Z11005 Partners in Care Services $1,736.00

Z14172 Economy Epinephrine Injector .15mg 2-Pack* *call for price 

Z14173 Economy Epinephrine Injector .3mg 2-Pack* *call for price 

Z14190 Sterile Water $10.99

Z14246 PlusOptix Warranty $295.00

Z14247 PlusOptix Warranty $738.00

Z14248 PlusOptix Warranty $1,180.00

Z17114 Narcan $239.99

Z75227 Sodium Chloride $6.94

Z75229 Epinephrine Ampules $19.99 

Z75231 Albuterol Inhaler $63.95

Z75232 Albuterol Inhalation Solution $19.95

Items may be added without notice to the "No Bid" list; items noted with (NB) on your invoice indicate "No Bid." Pricing is subject to change. 
William V. MacGill and Co., 1000 N. Lombard Rd., Lombard, IL 60148  (800) 323-2841   macgill@macgill.com 
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