
BID RECAP  - Bid Number 170-17/18

Ad dates:  April 4 and 11, 2018

Opening Date:   May 1, 2018 Place :  Room 305

Contractor Name Job Time Verdugo R.D. White Muir Balboa Lincoln Alternates: Comments

Walk Stamp Woodlands

No. 1

No. 2

1.  Paradise Construction & Contract x x No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $12,400.00 No. 3

      Management, Inc. No. 4 $900.00

No. 5 $900.00

No. 6 $67,000.00

No. 7 $19,200.00

Demolish 

Single 

Relocatable

$9,700.00

No. 1 $29,777.00

No. 2 $29,777.00

2.  Cybertech Construction $378,777.00 $448,777.00 $148,777.00 $398,777.00 No Bid No. 3 $59,777.00 Did not use the 

No. 4 $24,777.00 revised bid form.

No. 5 $24,777.00 So, did not bid 

No. 6 $798,777.00 for Lincoln

No. 7 $178,777.00

Demolish 

Single 

Relocatable

$69,777.00

Play Area Improvements at Verdugo Woodlands, R.D. White, Muir, and Balboa Elementary Schools
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