QQ 19/20-1619DK The School Board of Charlotte County, FL Opened: July 1, 2019 at 2:00 p.m.
Portable Radio Repair Parts Awarded 7/26/2019 through 7/25/2020

Posted Tabulation

Portable Radio Repair Parts
QQ 19/20-1619DK

Holzberg ICOM nghtnlng
L ) Wireless
Communications America .
Vendor-> Soultions
4 4 2
Line . o Equivalent: Power . . L
Qty ICOM Description / Item Code Unit Price . Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price
Item Products Unlimited
ICOM F2000D Radio Batteries
1 1 Li-lon Battery 7.2V 1570mAh $70.00 BP279LIXT $49.00 $43.93 No Bid
BP-279
ICOM F2000D Rapid Charger
2 1 |Li-lon Battery $67.00 EC1-IC7LI $49.50 $26.36 No Bid
BC-123S and BC-213
ICOM F2100D Radio Batteries
3 1 Li-lon Battery 7.2V 2280mAh $61.00 No Bid $53.34 No Bid
BP-280
ICOM F2100D Rapid Charger - OEM
4 1 |Li-lon Battery $65.00 No Bid $26.36 No Bid
BC-123SA and BC213
ICOM F4210D Radio Batteries
5 1 NiMH Battery 7.4V 1400mAh $43.00 BP264MH-1 $33.00 $26.98 No Bid
BP-264
ICOM F4210D Radio Batteries
6 1 |Li-lon Battery 7.4V 1900mAh $62.00 BP265LI $45.00 $38.91 No Bid
BP-265
ICOM F4210D Rapid Charger No Longer No Longer
7 1 Ni-MH Battery . EC1-IC6MH $49.50 . No Bid
Available Available

BC-123S and BC-191
ICOM F4210D Rapid Charger
8 1 |Li-lon Battery $92.00 EC1-IC6ALI $49.50 $42.04 No Bid
BC-123S and BC-193
ICOM F4230D Radio Batteries

9 1 Li-lon Battery 7.2V 2250mAh $75.00 BP232LIWP $47.00 $47.06 No Bid
BP-232WP
ICOM F4230D Rapid Charger

10 1 |Li-lon Battery $92.00 EC1-IC3B $49.50 $42.04 No Bid

BC-123S and BC-160

EF Johnson 5100 Antenna
11 1 |700/800 Mhz, 1/2 Wave Whip $95.00 No Bid No Bid $45.79
(800MHz) Antenna

EF Johnson Single Unit Charger

12 1 |5000 Series $99.00 No Bid No Bid $77.50
KSC-32
EF Johnson 5300 Antenna
13 1 |764-869 Mhz On-Glass Antenna, $49.90 No Bid No Bid $80.50
14" RG58/U KG3E766UD
14 1 |EF Johnson 5300 Microphone $140.00 No Bid No Bid $76.50
Shipping Included Included Included
Delivery: 1-2 Weeks ARO 1-2Weeks ARO |1-2Weeks ARO

The District Recommends ICOM America for items 1 through 6 & 8 through 10, Holzberg Communication for Vendor Location Legend:

items 7 & 13, and Lightning Wireless Solutions for items 11, 12 & 14, as the low, responsive, responsible 1. Charlotte County

bidders meeting the District's specifications, and terms and conditions. 2. Regional

(Hillsborough-Collier Counties)

3. State of Florida

Debra King, Buyer 4. Outside State of Florida in U.S.A.




